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ABOUT

Angel Chreston joined Hanna Brophy as an
associate in the Oakland o몭ce in 2017. She
defends self-insured employers, including
public entities, and insurance carriers in all
aspects of workers’ compensation litigation.

Angel graduated from the University of
California, Davis, with a Bachelor of Arts
degree in political science, and a minor in
English. After earning her undergraduate
degree, she attended the University of
California Davis, School of Law (King Hall),
where she graduated with her Juris Doctor
and a certi몭cate in public interest. While at
King Hall, Angel studied negotiation, served
on the Trial Practice Honors Board, and
interned for various district attorneys’
o몭ces.

In her free time, Angel enjoys reading,
hiking, cooking, and spending time with her
family.

Professional Activities

Angel is a regular presenter and writer of
Workers Compensation Bingo. She also
gives regular in-house presentations to
insurance carriers, third party
administrators, and public entities on new
workers’ compensation laws.

How Am I Green?

I work from home, avoid single-use plastics,
and own an electric vehicle

SERVICES

Workers' Compensation Defense

EDUCATION

https://www.hannabrophy.com/office/oakland
tel:510-446-2125
mailto:achreston@hannabrophy.com
https://www.hannabrophy.com/services/workers-compensation/

